BID TABULATION - BID SUBMISSION

ITB 47-25 "Housing Rehabilitation Services"
Florencie J. Underwood, Principal Buyer

Jolanda Green, Buyer

Email: underwoodf@)jccal.org & greenjo@jccal.org
Phone: 205-714-3747 & 205-521-7592

PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED RYCAR
1 HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUSTRIES LLC
Albert Taylor LLC CONSTRUCTION
316 58th Street Bedroom Repairs| $ 20,000.00 | $ 38,400.00 NO BID
Fairfield, Al. 36064 Miscellaneous Repairs| $ 19,600.00 | $ 16,400.00 NO BID
(205) 413-1601 Safety| $ 400.00 | $ 900.00 NO BID
Case #24-20-1 PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #1| § 40,000.00 | $ 55,700.00 NO BID
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #1| $ 40,000.00 | $ 55,700.00 NO BID
PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
REDESIGNED FRANKLIN
RYCAR
LIVING & HERITAGE
Angelaz Ashley CONSTRUCTION HOMES LLC INDUSTRIES LLC
Kitchen Repairs| $ 2,800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 5,868.80
1905 Mathews Avenue Hand Rails| $ 350.00 | § 750.00 | 417.46
Lipscomb, AL 35020 y - -
(205) 616-2833 Kitchen and Dining Room Ceilings| $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 2,000.00
Case # A-23-AA-2 Safety| $ 550.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 203.82
PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #2| $ 7,500.00 | $ 8,350.00 | $ 8,490.08
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FORITEM #2{ $ 7,500.00 | $ 8,150.00 | $ -
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PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED
3 INDUlgzl(iﬁEl; LLC HERITAGE LIVING &
Debra Jones HOMES LLC CONSTRUCTION
1512 Carol Circle Main Bathroom Repairs| $ 647.30 | § 850.00 [ § 900.00
Midfield, AL 35228 Miscellaneous Repairs| $ 3,020.69 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 17,640.00
(205) 612-0503 Safety| $ 203.82 | $ 400.00 | $ 500.00
Case #24-17-1 PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #3| $ 3,871.81 $11,750.00] $ 19,040.00
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #3| $ 4,121.81 | $ 11,750.00 | $ 19,040.00
PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED
RYCAR
HERITAGE LIVING &
INDUSTRIES LLC.
Josenn 4 - INTDADR SLLC. | HOMESLLC | CONSTRUCTION
2 ;ﬁ:’gg;‘veoo J valjzue Main Bathroom Repairs| $ 6,089.72 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 10,300.00
Fairfield, AL 35064 Kitchen C'abinets $ 327199 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00
Case # 24-14-1 Safety| $ 203.82 | $ 400.00 | $ 600.00
PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #4| $ 18,945.53 | $ 36,800.00 | $ 37,400.00
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #4| $ 19,195.53 | $ 36,800.00 | $ 37,400.00
PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
6 REDESIGNED FRANKLIN ETENR
LuRee Early LIVING & HERITAGE INDUSTRIES LLC
4216 Lloyd Noland CONSTRUCTION HOMES LL.C
Parkway Windows Replacement| $ 28,400.00 | § 39,500.00 NO BID
Fairfield, AL 35064 Safety| $ 600.00 | $ 400.00 NO BID
(205) 515-6714 PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #6| $ 29,000.00 | $ 39,900.00 NO BID
Case #A-ST-24-LE-1 BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #6| $ 29,000.00 | $ 39,900.00 NO BID
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PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
| CE | e
INDUSTRIES LLC
Mmshe; Flucker LLC CONSTRUCTION
Replace Back| $ 5,250.00 | $ 7,800.00 NO BID
512 Jerry Coleman Street -
Fairfield, AL 35064 Windows Replacement| $ 9,700.00 | $ 18,650.00 NO BID
(205) 563-8597 Eaves and Soffitt and Gutters| $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 NO BID
Case # MF-2024-1 Safety| $ 400.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID
PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #7| $ 18,850.00 | $ 30,550.00 NO BID
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #7( $ 18,850.00 | $ 30,550.00 NO BID
PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
REDESIGNED FRANKLIN
RYCAR
8 INDUSTRIES LLC LIVING & HERITAGE
Ora Johnson CONSTRUCTION HOMES LLC
5301 6th Avenue North Main Bathroom Repairs| $ 9,601.21 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 13,500.00
Lipscomb, AL 35020 Kitchen Repairs| $ 3,648.16 | $ 4,850.00 | $ 2,250.00
(205) 426-0758 Safety| $ 203.82 | $ 600.00 | $ 400.00
Case #23-J0-2 PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #8] $ 13,543.19 [ $ 13,650.00 | $ 16,150.00
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #8| $ 13,793.19 | § 13,650.00 | $ 16,150.00
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PROPERTY # WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3

FRANKLIN REDESIGNED RYCAR

9 HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUSTRIES LLC
Patricia Gray LLC CONSTRUCTION

510 43rd Street Miscellaneous Repairs| $ 2,800.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 3,388.22

Fairfield, AL 36064 Window Replacement| $ 20,240.00 | $ 20,000.00 NO BID
(205) 639-3396 Safety| $ 400.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 203.82
Case #REB-924-PG-1 PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #9| $ 23,440.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 3,592.04
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #9| § 23,400.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 3,842.09

PROPERTY# WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED
HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUl:S{¥ISﬁEl§ LLC
Regin:?mums LLC CONSTRUCTION
. Replace Back Deck| $ 9,500.00 | $ 16,000.00 NO BID
749 Meadowbrook Drive -

Birmingham, AL 35215 Window Replacement| $ 10,560.00 | $ 22,000.00 NO BID

(205) 413-3926 Eaves and Soffitts and Gutters| $ 16,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 NO BID

Case # A-R-23-RA-1 Safety| $ 400.00 | $ 500.00 NO BID

PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #10 $ 37,260.00 | $ 42,300.00 NO BID

BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #10| $ 37,260.00 | $ 42,300.00 NO BID
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WORK WRITEUP 1 2 3
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED RYCAR
11 HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUSTRIES LLC
Rufus Peyton LLC CONSTRUCTION
401 18th Avenue NW Livingroom and Bedroom Floors| $ 7,500.00 | $ 16,350.00 NO BID
Centerpoint, AL 35215 Paint Bedroom Ceiling| $ 800.00 [ $ 1,200.00 NO BID
(52553 262?1'21‘;32 Walker Ramps| $ 750.00 | $ 6,700.00 NO BID
Safety| $ 400.00 | $ 600.00 NO BID
PURCHASING'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #11{ $ 9.450.00 | $ 24,850.00 NO BID
BIDDER'S TOTAL AMOUNT FOR ITEM #11] g 9,450.00 | $ 24,850.00 NO BID
FRANKLIN REDESIGNED RYCAR
DISCOUNTS: The following discounts will be considered in award of bid. |HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUSTRIES LLC
LLC CONSTRUCTION

a.[ Award of all items. Indicate any additional discount for award of all items to your

company: %.

0%

0%

0%

b.[Payment Discount. Discount for payment of invoice within 20 days of receipt
is: %. Payment discounts of 20 or more days will be considered in award of
bid. The County will not take discounts that are not earned.

0%

0%

0%
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FRANKLIN REDESIGNED RYCAR
REQUIRED FORMS HERITAGE HOMES LIVING & INDUSTRIES LLC
LLC CONSTRUCTION
Experience Statement Yes Yes Yes
Subcontractors List Yes Yes Yes/None at this time
Notification of Intent to Respond Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collustion Affidavit Yes Yes Yes
Affidavit of Contractor Yes Yes Yes
Jefferson County, AL Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form Yes Yes Yes
Debarment Statement Yes Yes Yes
Signature Page Yes Yes Yes
Amendment #1 Acknowledgement No Yes No
Home Builder License Yes Yes Yes
Certificate of Liability Insurance Yes Yes No
Jefferson County Business License Yes Yes Yes

CONTACT INFORMATION
LN L 559 Valley Road, Birmingham, Alabama 35206 | Contact: DeAndre Franklin, Managing Member | Phone: 205-259-8052
HERITAGE HOMES . , , ,
LLC or 205-821-9531 | Email: franklinheritagehomes@gmail.com
REDESIGNED .
P.O. Box 294, Pleasant Grove, Alabama 35127 | Contact: Rodregas Powell, Owner | Phone: 205-368-0236 | Email:
LLINVINIE &2 redesignedlivingl @gmail.com
CONSTRUCTION '
RYCAR INDUSTRIES |424 Reid Road, Trafford, Alabama 35172 | Contact: Carmen Beatty, Co-Owner | Phone: 205-600-4077 or 205-964-4448 |
LLC Email: shortstopcarmen@gmail.com
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